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FOREWORD

This publication is designed to give Marine leaders a solid, com-
mon understanding of the fundamental nature of military strategy
that is inherent in each military action. Its intent is to give the
reader the basic knowledge required to think “strategically,” that
is, to be able to examine the particulars of any specific situation
and understand the political and military factors behind the use of
military force.

Marine Corps Doctrinal Publication (MCDP) 1-1 provides the
foundation for thinking strategically. This foundation will enable
Marines to better understand their roles in a particular situation
and to consider the implications of their actions on the military
strategy being employed and the political objectives that strategy
is intended to achieve.

Just as it is important to appreciate what this publication is
designed to do, it is equally important to understand what this
publication does not seek to do. It does not attempt to provide a
solution to current strategic problems, nor is it concerned with
details of current American strategy. MCDP 1-1 does not assume
that war and military strategy are exclusively a matter of interna-
tional or interstate behavior, and the concepts discussed in it are



not limited to any particular kind of warfare or level of conflict.
Nor does Strategy prescribe any particular strategy, any particular
process for the making of strategy, or any specific techniques and
procedures for handling military forces. It is meant to educate the
mind of future commanders or, more accurately, to guide them in
their self-education, not to accompany them to the battlefield.

Chapter 1 explores the complex nature of the strategic environ-
ment, including the relationship between war and politics and the
key factors at work in any strategic situation. Chapter 2 discusses
the essential elements of any strategy, the relationship of ends and
means, and the interaction among political objectives, national
strategy, and military strategy. Chapter 3 looks at a variety of
strategies as they might be developed in different strategic situa-
tions. Chapter 4 synthesizes the concepts presented in the first
three chapters by focusing on how strategy is made, who makes
it, what moral criteria guide strategic decisions, and what pitfalls
may occur in the making of strategy.

This publication is primarily for field grade officers. However,
Marines at all levels require a broad perspective and an under-
standing of how the effects of their actions can influence the attain-
ment of our national objectives. Furthermore, Marines of any rank
or specialty can easily find themselves working for senior leaders
with strategic responsibilities. Those leaders need subordinates
who understand the strategic environment and can provide intelli-
gent and insightful advice on the strategic situation. Therefore, as a



foundation for strategic thought, this publication should be read
and understood by Marines at all levels of command both in the
operating forces and the supporting establishment.

C. C. KRULAK 
General, U.S. Marine Corps

Commandant of the Marine Corps
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Introduction

The Study of Strategy

“The nation that draws too great a distinction between its
scholars and its warriors will have its thinking done by cow-
ards and its fighting done by fools.”1

—Unknown





The Study of Strategy
Marine Corps Doctrinal Publication (MCDP) 1, Warfighting,
stresses that war is fundamentally political in character and that
war must serve policy. What matters ultimately in war is strategic
success: attainment of our political aims and the protection of our
national interests. History shows that national leaders, both politi-
cal and military, who fail to understand this relationship sow the
seeds for ultimate failure—even when their armed forces achieve
initial battlefield success. Battlefield brilliance seldom rescues a
bad strategy.

The United States Marine Corps is a key instrument in the execu-
tion of American national strategy. Marine expeditionary forces
possess extraordinary strategic reach. As an expeditionary force-
in-readiness, the Marine Corps has been consistently called upon
to implement key elements of our national security strategy and
its supporting national military strategy. While the Marine Corps
is not a strategy-making organization in the sense of designing a
national military strategy or even drafting strategies to fight par-
ticular wars, the effective execution of strategy requires an under-
standing of both its intent and its context. In order to carry out our
responsibilities to the Nation, Marines must possess the strategic
skills and understanding necessary to participate effectively in the
strategic environment of the 21st century.
 Introduction-3
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